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Shoulder and Elbow Update 2008 
Course Faculty 

 
Gerald R. Williams, Jr., MD:  Professor of Orthopaedic Surgery, Thomas Jefferson 
University, Rothman Institute Orthopaedics, Philadelphia, PA.  Multiple peer-reviewed 
journal publications, book chapters, and co-editor of several books on shoulder 
diagnosis and surgery.  Has lectured locally, nationally, and internationally about the 
treatment of shoulder disorders.  Active member and president-elect, American 
Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
Matthew L. Ramsey, MD:  Associate Professor of Orthopaedic Surgery, Thomas 
Jefferson University, Rothman Institute Orthopaedics, Philadelphia, PA.  Shoulder and 
elbow surgeon.  Multiple publications in peer-reviewed journals, and book chapters on 
the evaluation and management of shoulder and elbow disorders.  He is a co-editor of 
Shoulder and Elbow Arthroplasty.  Dr. Ramsey has lectured locally, nationally, and 
internationally.  Active member, American Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
David L. Glaser, MD:  Assistant Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, University of 
Pennsylvania.  Several publications in peer-reviewed journals and book chapters.  Has 
lectured locally and nationally on shoulder disorders.  Associate member, American 
Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
Martin J. Kelley, PT, DPT, OCS:  Musculoskeletal Team Leader, Good Shepherd Penn 
Partners, Penn Therapy and Fitness, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center, Philadelphia, 
PA.  Numerous publications in peer-reviewed journals, monographs, and book chapters.  
Co-author of the book Orthopedic Therapy of the Shoulder.  Dr. Kelley has lectured 
locally, nationally, and internationally.  Active member and past-president, American 
Society of Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
Brian G. Leggin, PT, DPT, OCS:  Advanced Clinician II, Good Shepherd Penn 
Partners, Penn Therapy and Fitness, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center, Philadelphia, 
PA.  Numerous peer-reviewed research articles, monographs, and book chapters on 
shoulder disorders and outcome measurement.  Dr. Leggin has also lectured locally, 
nationally, and internationally.  Active member and past-president, American Society of 
Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
 
Joseph Abboud, MD:  Assistant Professor, Orthopedic Surgery, University of 
Pennsylvania Health System, 3B Orthopaedics, Pennsylvania Hospital.  Fellowship 
trained shoulder surgeon.  Several peer-reviewed research publications. 
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John Basti, PT:  Director, Physical Therapy Rehabilitation Associates of NJ.  Adjunct 
Clinical Faculty, College of Physicians and Surgeons, Columbia University.  Consultant, 
Lecturer, Columbia University Center for Shoulder, Elbow, and Sports Medicine.  
Lectured locally, nationally, and internationally.  Peer-reviewed publications and book 
chapters.  Founding member and past-president, American Society of Shoulder and 
Elbow Therapists. 
 
Timothy Bayruns, PT, DPT, OCS:  Musculoskeletal Team Leader, Good Shepherd 
Penn Partners, Penn Therapy and Fitness, Philadelphia, PA.  Adjunct instructor, 
Thomas Jefferson University. 
 
Pedro K. Beredjikian, MD:  Assistant Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, University of 
Pennsylvania Health System, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center.  Peer-reviewed 
publications and book chapters on diagnosis and surgery of the hand and elbow.  
Lectured locally, nationally, and internationally. 
 
 
David J. Bozentka, MD:  Associate Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, University of  
Pennsylvania Health System, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center.  Peer-reviewed 
publications and book chapters on diagnosis and surgery of the hand and elbow.  
Lectured locally, nationally, and internationally. 
 
Brian Cammarota, Med, ATC, CSCS:  Minor league rehabilitation coordinator, 
Philadelphia Phillies, Clearwater, FL. 
 
Will Clark, PT, MSc:  Director, Reading Sports Medicine.  Co-author of Orthopaedic 
Therapy of the Shoulder.  Lectured locally and nationally.  Member and past education 
committee chair of the American Society of Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
Phillip B. Donley, PT, MS, ATC:  Chester County Sports Medicine. Consultant physical 
therapist, Philadelphia Phillies.  Lectured locally and nationally. 
 
David Ebaugh, PhD, PT, OCS:  Assistant Professor, Physical Therapy and 
Rehabilitation Sciences, Drexel University.  Multiple peer-reviewed research articles, 
local and national presentations.  Active member and research committee chair, 
American Society of Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
Brian Eckenrode, MSPT, OCS:  Senior Physical Therapist, Good Shepherd Penn 
Partners, Penn Therapy and Fitness, Penn Sports Medicine.  Lectured locally and 
nationally. 
 
Jane Fedorczyk, PhD, PT, ATC, CHT:  Director, Post-Professional Clinical Programs, 
Coordinator, Programs in hand and Upper Quarter Rehabilitation, Clinical Assistant 
Professor, Physical Therapy and Rehabilitation Sciences, Drexel University, 
Philadelphia, PA.  Numerous publications and presentations on local, state, national, 
and international level. 
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John Fenlin, MD:  Clinical Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, Thomas Jefferson 
University, Rothman Institute Orthopaedics, Philadelphia, PA.  Published peer-reviewed 
articles, book chapters, local, national, and international lectures.  Active member, 
American Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
Ted Ganley, MD:  Assistant Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, The Children’s Hospital of 
Philadelphia.  Multiple peer-reviewed publications.  Lectured at local, state, and national 
meetings. 
 
Charles Getz, MD:  Clinical Assistant Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, Thomas 
Jefferson University, Rothman Institute Orthopaedics, Philadelphia, PA.  Published 
peer-reviewed articles, book chapters, local and national lectures. 
 
Joseph Gianoni, PT, DPT, OCS:  Director, Phoenix Rehabilitation Services.  Local and 
national presentations.  Active member and past secretary-treasurer, American Society 
of Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
G. Russell Huffman, MD:  Associate Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, University of 
Pennsylvania Health System.  Several peer-reviewed publications and lectures on local, 
state, and national level on shoulder and elbow disorders. 
 
Joseph P. Iannotti, MD, PhD:  Chairman, Department of Orthopaedic Surgery, 
Chairman, Orthopaedic and Rheumatology Institute, Madden Professor Orthopaedic 
Surgery, Cleveland Clinic Lerner School of Medicine, Cleveland Ohio.  Hundreds of 
research publications, book chapters, monographs, and co-editor of several books.  
Past-president, American Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons.  Internationally renowned 
speaker on surgery of the shoulder.  Active member and past-president, American 
Shoulder and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
Christopher Kauffman, MSPT:  Good Shepherd Penn Partners, Penn Therapy and 
Fitness, Penn Sports Medicine Center, Philadelphia, PA.  Published book chapters and 
lectured locally and nationally. 
 
Mark Lazarus, MD:  Rothman Institute Orthopaedics, Shoulder and Elbow Surgeon.  
Extensive bibliography of research articles and book chapters.  He has presented at 
local, national, and international meetings. 
 
Sean Loughlin, MSPT, OCS:  Good Shepherd Penn Partners, Penn Therapy and 
Fitness.  Presented at national meetings. 
 
Phil McClure, PhD, PT, OCS:  Professor of Physical Therapy, Arcadia University. His 
publications have appeared in several journals including Spine, Clinical Biomechanics, 
Physical Therapy, Journal of Shoulder and Elbow Surgery and Journal of Orthopedic 
and Sports Physical Therapy. His research has been funded by the Arthritis Foundation, 
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the Foundation for Physical Therapy, the National Athletic Trainers Association, and the 
National Institutes of Health.  He has lectured locally, nationally, and internationally. 
 
Joseph T. Molony, PT, MS, SCS, CSCS:  Director, The Children’s Hospital of 
Philadelphia, Sports Medicine Center, King of Prussia, PA.  Lectured locally and 
nationally. 
 
Marisa Pontillo, DPT, SCS:  Good Shepherd Penn Partners, Penn Therapy and 
Fitness, Penn Sports Medicine Center, Philadelphia, PA.  Marisa has published 
research in a peer-reviewed journal.   
 
Brian J. Sennett, MD:  Associate Professor, Orthopaedic Surgery, Director, Penn 
Sports Medicine, Philadelphia, PA.  Peer-reviewed research publications, local and 
national presentations. 
 
Gayle Severance, OTR/L, CHT:  Good Shepherd Penn Partners, Penn Therapy and 
Fitness, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center, Philadelphia, PA 
 
Michael A. Shaffer, MSPT, OCS, ATC:  Clinical specialist, University of Iowa Hospitals 
and Clinics.  Instructor, University of Iowa Athletic Training.  Peer-reviewed research 
publications, numerous local, state, national, and international presentations.  Active 
member and past-president, American Society of Shoulder and Elbow Therapists. 
 
Scott Sheridan, MSPT, ATC:  Head Athletic Trainer, Philadelphia Phillies, 
Philadelphia, PA.  Lectured at national meetings. 
 
Lou Soslowsky, PhD:  Professor, Department of Orthopaedic Surgery, University of 
Pennsylvania.  Dr. Soslowsky has published over 70 research articles and numerous 
book chapters.  He has also lectured locally, nationally, and internationally at 
professional meetings and academic institutions.  Affiliate member, American Shoulder 
and Elbow Surgeons. 
 
David R. Steinberg, MD:  Associate Professor of Orthopaedic Surgery, Director, Hand 
& Upper Extremity Fellowship, University of Pennsylvania Health System.  Several 
peer-reviewed research articles and national presentations. 
 
Angela R. Tate, PhD, PT:  H/S Therapy Associates, Adjunct Faculty, Arcadia 
University.  Dr. Tate has several peer-reviewed research publications and has lectured 
locally and nationally. 
 
Laura Walsh, OTR/L, CHT:  Lead Hand Therapist, Good Shepherd Penn Partners, 
Penn Therapy and Fitness, Penn Presbyterian Medical Center, Philadelphia, PA.  
Published book chapters and presented locally and nationally. 
 
 
 


